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President and CEO of Optum Pacific West                                          
Joins IKS Health Advisory Board  

 
 

Dallas, TX, 6 October, 2021 – IKS Health, a premier physician enterprise enablement platform, today 
announced that Dr. Amar Desai, President and CEO of Optum Pacific West will join the company’s 
Advisory Board.  
 
Guiding IKS Health’s strategic direction and helping the company better understand market trends, 
the IKS Health Advisory Board is comprised of leaders from across the healthcare industry. Current 
members include executives from medical groups, industry consultancies, digital health companies 
and healthcare non-profit companies.  
 
“We are thrilled to have Dr. Amar Desai join our growing list of industry innovators that make up our 
Advisory Board,” said Sachin Gupta, Founder and CEO of IKS Health. “As a go-to resource for 
organizations looking to scale, improve quality and achieve cost savings, Dr. Desai will help IKS 
continue to enhance our delivery of exceptional healthcare for physicians, medical groups and 
health systems.” 
 
Dr. Amar Desai works at the intersection of direct patient care and health care systems, overseeing 
Optum Pacific West’s care delivery organizations throughout California, Oregon, and Washington, 
which collectively include more than 25,000 physicians serving nearly 2.6 million patients. On joining 
the Advisory Board, Dr. Desai said, “Developing scalable delivery models that improve clinical 
outcomes, increase affordability and transform patient experiences have been at the heart of my 
work since my time as a physician and remain true today in my role at Optum. I am excited to 
continue this journey by helping position IKS Health as a world-class healthcare solutions company.” 
 
About IKS Health  
 
IKS Health enables the enhanced delivery of exceptional health care for today’s practicing physician, 
medical groups and health systems. Supporting health care providers through every function of the 
patient visit, IKS Health is a go-to resource for organizations looking to effectively scale, improve 
quality and achieve cost savings through integrated technology and forward-thinking solutions. 
Founded in 2007, the 4,500+ member strong workforce at IKS Health includes close to 700 
physicians, 150+ technicians along with 3000+ Revenue Cycle Management professionals and 
manages more than $6 billion in revenue for more than 30,000 client physicians throughout the 
United States. 
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